COUNCIL OF THE DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA

NOTICE

Pursuant to Section 412 of the District of Columbia Self-
Government and Governmental Reorganization Act, PL 93-198, ( the Act ),
the Council of the District of Celumbia adopted Bill No. 1-120 on f{irst
and second readings May 3, 1976 and May 18, 13976, respectively.
Following the signature of the Mayor on June 18, 1976, this legislation
was assigned Act No. 1-131, published in zi;xe June 29, 1976, edition of
the D.C . Register, and transmitted to both Houses of Congress for a
30-day review, In accordance with Section 602 (cT{l) of the Act.

The Council ¢of the District of Columbia hereby gives notice
that the 30-day Congressional review period has expired and therefore,

cites the legislation as D.C. Law 1-79, gffective September 2, 1975.

V.-

STERLING TUCKER
Chairman of the Council

(Ref: 22D.C.Reg,7183,June 29, 1976)



D.C. LAW 1-79

In the Council of the District of Columbia

September 2, 1976

To organize the Board of Elections and Ethics of the District of
Columbia, and for other purposes.

BE 1T ENACTED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA,
Tpnat this act may be cited as the "District of Columbia Election
Act Amendments of 1576%.

TITLE I -- ORGANIZATION OF BOARD OF ELECTIONS

Sec. 101. This title may be cited as the "Elections
Organization act of 197év.

Sec. 102. The District of Columbia Election Act (D.C. Code,
secs. 1-110]1 et seq.) is amended as follows:

(1) Section 2(4) of such Act (D.C. Code, sec. 1-1102(4)) is
amended by striking out "Board" under section 5(a) (4) and
inserting in lieu thereof “Council".

(2) Section 3(¢c) of such Act (D.C. Code, sec. 1l-1103(c)) is
amended to read as follows:

“(c) A member may be reappointed to one additional term. No

member shall serve beyond the expiration of the term to whica such



- # ™

‘Eorelléd. Origisel

member was appointed unless such member is reappointed.”

(3) Section 4 of such Act (D.C. Code, sec. 1-1104) is
amended by inserting at the end thareof the following:

*(d) (1) The Mayor may remove any member of the Board who
engages in any activity prohibited by subsections (a} or (b), and
appoint a2 new member %o serve until the expiration of the term of
the membar so removed. When the Mayor believes that any member
has engaged in any such activity he shall nctify such member, in
writing, ¢f the charge against him and that such member has seven
days in which to request a hearing before the Council on such
charge, £ such member fails to request a hearing within seven
days after receiving such nctics then the Mayor may remcve such
member anéd appeint a new member, ‘

"(2) The hearing requested by a member may be either open
or closed, as rsgquested by such member, In the event such hearing
is closed, the vote ¢of the Council as a result of such hearing
shall be taken at an open meeting of the Council. The Council shall
begiz such hearings within seven calendar days after receiving
notice from tha Mayor indicating that a member has requested such
a hearing. If two-thirds of the Council vote =0 remove such member
then such member shall be removed,

"(e) Any vacancy cccurring on the Board shall be filled
withi=~ forty-five days after the cecurrence of such vacancy,

excluding Saturdays, Sundays, and holidays."



firolled Origisal

-

(4) Section 4 of such Act (D.C. Code, sec. 1-1104) is
further amended by redesignating subsection (b) as subsacticn
{(¢), ané by inserting the following immediately aftsr subsecticn
(a):

"{b) No person, while a member of the Board, shall
(1) campaign for any other public office, (2) hold any cffice
in any pelitical party or pelitical committee, (3) participate
in or centribute ta'any political campaign of any candidate in
any election held under this Act, (4) act in his capacity as a
member, to directly or indirectly attempt to influence any
decisicn of a District government agency, department, or instru-
mentality relating to any action which is beyond the juris-
diction of the Board, or (3) be convicted of_having committed
a felony in the District ¢of Columbia; or if the crime is
committed elsewhere, conviction cof such cffense as would be a
felony in the District of Columbia.”

(5) Section 5 of such Act (D.C. Code, sec., 1-~1105) is
amended by (A) striking cut "and" in paragraph (8) thereof;

(B) redesignating paragraph (9) as paragraph (ll); and (C)
inserting the following paragraphs immediately after paragrarh
(8) thereof:

"(9) take all reascnable steps to inform all residents
and voters of elections and means of casting votes therein;

"(10) take all reascnable steps to register overseas

citizen voters as provided by the Overseas Citizens Voting Rights



- Farolled Originel

Act of 1875, (P.L. 94~-203); and”

(6) Section 5 of such Act (B.C. Code, sec. 1-1105) is
further amended by inserting at the end thereof the following:

"{h) Neotwithstanding provisions of the District of
Columbia Administrative Procedure Act (D.C. Code, sec. 1-1501
et seq.), the Board may hear any challenge brought to it under
this Act by one member panels. An appeal from a decision cof any
such one member panel may be taken to either the full Board or
to the District ¢f Columbia Court of Appeals, at the coption of
any adversely affectad party. If appeal is taken directly to
the District of Columbia Court of Appeals, the decision of a
one member panel shall be, for purposes cof such apéeal, considered
to be a final decision of the Beoard., If an appeal is taken from
a decision of a cne member panel to the £full Board, the decisicn
of the one member piﬁel shall be stayed pending a final decision of
the Board. The Board may, upon a vota of the majority of its
members, hear de novo all issues of fact or law relating to an
appeal of a decision of a cone member panel, except the Board may
decide to consider only the record made before such one member
panel, A final decision of the full Board, relating to an appeal
brought to it from a cone member panel, shall be appealable toc the
District of Columbia Court of Appeals in the same manner and to
the same extent as all other final decisions cf the Board.”

(7} Section 8(p) of such Act (D.C. Code, sec. 1-1108
(p) (2)) is amended by striking "eight" in the fourth line thereof
and inserting in lieu thereof "fiftaen”.

(8) Subsections (a)(l) (B} and (o) (A) of Section 8 of such

Act (D.C. Ccde, secs. 1-1108(a) (1) (B), (o) (A)) are each amended



Zorolled Origimal

by striking "sixtieth" wherever it appears in those subsections
and Lnscrting<ﬁ?1iau thereof in each subsection "sixty ninth",

(9) Subsections (i) (1)(B), (1)(3), and (o) of Section 8
of such Act (D.C. Code, secs. 1-1108(i) (1) (B), (i)(3), (o)) are
each amended by striking "one hundred fourteenth" wherever it
appears in those subsecticns and inserting in lieu therecf in
each subsection "one hundred 4wenty thirxd",

(10) Subsecticns (i) (3) and (o) of Section 8 of such
Act (D.C. Code, secs. 1-1108 (i) (3}, (o)) are each amended by
striking "eighty fifth" wherever it appears in those subsections
and inserting in lieu thereof in each subsection "ninety fourth”.

(11) Subsection (j) (1) (B) of Section 8 of such Act
(0.C. Code, sec. 1-1108(3j) (1) (B})) is amended by -striking “cne
hundred fourteen” and inserting in lieu thereof "one hundred

-cwenty three”.

(12) Subsections (1) (1) (A}, (i) (2)(A), and (3) (1) (A)
of Section 8 of such Act (D.C. Ccde, secs. 1-1108 (i) (1) (a),

(1) (2) (&), (3) (1) (A)) are each amended by striking "sixty"
wherever it appears in thcse subsecticns and inserting in lieu
thereof in each subsection "sixty nine“".

Sac. 103. The provisicns of this title shall take effect
at the end of the thirty day period of review provided for acts
of the Council in secticn 602(c) of the District of Columbia
Self-Government and Governmental Reorganization Act (D.C. Czde,

sec., 1-147(ec)).



‘Eorolled Originat

»

TITLE II -- CONFLICTS OF INTEREST
AND DISCLOSURE

Sec. 201. This title may be cited as the "Conflicts of
Interest and Disclosure Amendments Act of 1976“ﬂ

Sac. 202. Section 601 of the District of Columbia Conflict
of Interest Act (D.C. Code, sec. 1-1181) is amended as follows:

(1) Subsection (c) of such section (D.C. Code, sec. 1-1181
(c)) is amended by striking out "or which would cause the total
value of such things received from the same persen not a member
of such public cofficial's household to exceed $100 during any
single calendar year,”. *
| (2) Paragraph (1) cof subsection (i) of such section
(B.C. Code, sec. 1-1181(i){(l)) is amended to read as follows:

"{l) 'public official' means (A) the Mayor of the District
of Columbia, a member or the Chairman of the Council of the District
of Columbia, or a member of the District of Columbia Board of
Education; (B) an officer or employee of the District of Columbia
government who holds an appointment in the General Service schedule
classified as a GS~-15 or higher; (C} any person holding an appoint-
ment of the District of Columbla Board of Education as a Class 3 or
higher; cor (D) any person whe is otherwise empldyed by the District
of Columbia government entitled %o receive compensation at an annual

rate of $29,B8l8, or more."”



Enrolled Original

Sec. 203. Section 602 of the District of Columbia
Conflict of Interest Act (D.C. Code, sec, 1-1182) is amended
as follows:

{1) Subsection (b) of such section 602 (D.C. Code, sec.
1-1182 (b)) is amended by inserting "(1)" immediately after "(b)",
and by redesignating paragraphs (1), (2), and (3) thereof as
(a), (B), and (C) respectively.

(2) Subsection (b) of such section 602 (D.C. Code, sec.
1-1182(b)) is further amended by inserting "or any other employee
who makes field decisions listed in subsaction (b)(2) of this
section" immediately after "or any higher grade cr position®.

{3) Subsection (b) of such section 602 (D.C. Coda,
sec. 1-1182(b)) is further amended by adding the.following at
the end thereof:

"({2) (A) Any District of Columbia government emplovee
who makes decisions in areas of contracting, procurement,
administration of grants or subsidies, planning or developing
pclicies, inspecting, licensing, requlating, auditing, or acting
in areas of responsibility invelving any potential conflict cof
interest as the Board may determine, shall alsoc file a Confidential
Financial Statement containing the informaticn specified in para-
graph (1) of this subsection, PROVIDED, THAT tthBoard of Electicns
and Ethics shall cause to be printed in the District of Cclumbia
Register a list of all positicns by job classificaticn involving

field decisions, as defined in this subsection, within one hundred



SAroLlled. VFLgLEES -

twenty days of the effective date of this act, and that no person
shall be required to file under the provisions of this paragraph
until ninety days after the list has been published in the

District of Columbia Register.

"(B) An individual or class of individuals may be
exempted from the filing requirements of subsection 602(b) (1)
only upon a determination by the Board that the duties of the
individual or class of individuals do not involve decisions in
areas specified in paragraph (2) (A) of this subsection.”
= (4) Subsection (d) of such section 602 (D.C. Code, sec.
1-1182(d)) is amended by inserting at the end thereof the following:

"The Board shall publish, in the District of Columbia Register, not

later than the first day of June each year, the names of the candi-
daﬁes, officers, and employees who have filed a report under this
secticn. Any paper which has been filed with the Board for longer
than seven years, in accordance with the provisions of this section,
shall be returned to the perscn who filed it or his legal representa=-
tive. 1In the event of the deatg'or termination of service of the
'Hayo:, Chairxman or member of the Council of the District of
Columbia, or Chairman or member of the Board of Education of the
District of Columbia, or officer or employee of the District of
Columbia, such papers shall be returned uncpened to such individual,
or to the surviving spouse or ieqal representative of such
individual within cne year after such death or termination of
service."

(5} Subsection (g) of such section 602 (D.C. Code, sec.
1-1182(g)) is amended to read as follows:

"(g) For the purposes of any report required by

this section, any individual shall be considered to have been



Enrolled Original

a public official, if he has served as a public official for more
than thirty days during any calendar year.”

(6) Subsecticn (h) of such section 602 (D.C. Code, sec.
1-1182(h)) is amended by inserting at the end thereof the
following:

"(7) ‘'gift' means a payment, subscription,. advance,
forebearance, rendering or deposit of money, services or any
thing of value, unless consideration of equal or greater value is
received, for the purpose of influencing the actions of a public
official in making or influencing the making of an administrative
decisicn or legislative action:; and shall not include a political
contribution otherwise reported as required by law, a commercially
reasonable loan made in the ordinary ccocurse of business, or a gift
received from a member of the person's immediate family."

(7) Such section 602 (D.C. Code, sec. 1-1182) is further
amended by inserting at the end thereof the following:

"(3) No person shall unlawfully disclose cr use for
any purpose other than in accordance with the terms of this Act
any information contained in f£inancial statements required by this
Act."

(8) Such section 602(b) (D.C. Code, sec. 1l-1182(b)) is
further amended by inserting at the end thereof the following:

"(3) Before the first day of February of each year,
the chief executive of the Executive Branch of the District of
Columbia Government, the District of Coclumbia Court of Appeals, the
District of Columbia Supericr Court, the Council of the District

of Celumbia, the Board cof Educaticn, and any independent agency or



.arolled Origissl
B e

instrumentality of the District of Columbia-shall submit on behalf
of their respective agency, the names and current mailing addresses
of all persons required to file a Confidential Personal Financial
Disclosure Statement with the Director of Campaign Finance. It
shall be the responéibility of each chief executive to maintain

the currency of the names and current mailing addresses of all
perscns required to file under this Act, and to advise the

Director of Campaign Finance within twenty-one days of such person's
appointment, election, resignation, termination, or death."

Sec. 204. The provisicns of this title shall take effect
at the end of the thirty day period of review provided for acts
of the Council in section 602(c) of the District ¢f Columbia Self-
Government and Governmental Reorganization Act (D.C. Code, sec.
1-147(c)), PROVIDED, THAT the provisions of section 203(8) of
this act shall not become effective until thirty days after the
provisions of the amendment made by that section are implemented;

TITLE IITI -- LOBBYING

Sec. 301. This title may be cited as the "Lobbying
Amendments of 1976"%,

Sec. 302. Title V of the District of Columbia Campaign
Finance Reform and Conflict of Interest Act, (D.C. Code, sec.
1-1171--1-1180), is amended to read as follows:

"Sec. 501. DEFINITIONS. =-=-As used in this title, unless
the context requires otherwise-

"(a) The term 'administrative decision' means any action

by an executive agency to: (1) formulate or promulgate a rule,



Enrolled Original
- 1% -

requlation, or order; (2) issue a written official opinion
ragarding a matter within the competence of the executive agency:;
or (3) expend more than $5,000 in a contract which is let with
two or less bidders."

"(b) The term 'compensation' means any money or thing of
value received or to be received from a person acting as a
lobbyist, whether inp the form ¢f a fee, income, forebearance,
foregiveness, reimbursement, or any other form of recompense,
or any combination thereof, except where cocmpensation is to be
reported by or for a person whese lobbying is incidental to his
reqular employment it shall be sufficient to report a prorated amount
based on the percentage of the time devoted to lobbying.

"(e) The term 'executive agency' means a commission, board,
department, agency, office, or other body or official in the
executive branch of the District of Columbia government and any
independent body of the District of Columbia govermment that is not
a part of the legislative or judiecial branch.

"(d) The term 'gift' means a payment, subscription, advance,
forebearance, rendering cor depcsit of money, services or anything
of value, unless consideraticn of equal or greater value is
received, for the purpose of influencing the actions of a public
official in making or influencing the making of an administrative
decision or legislative acticn: and shall not include a politiral
contribution otherwise reported as required by law, a commercially

reasonable lcan made in the ordinary course of business, or a gift



uarolleg UIigiuBs

received from a member of-the person's household as defined by
section 601(i) (4) of this Act (D.C. Code, sec. 1-1151(i) (4)).

"(e) The term 'legislative action' includes any activity
conducted by an official in the legislative branch in the normal
course of carrying out his duties as such an official, and relating
to the introduction, passage or defeat of any legislation in the
Council, or to any acticn with respect to a matter which is within
the jurisdiction of the Council.

*(£) The term 'lobbying’ means communicating directly or
soliciting others to communicate with any official in the legis-
lative or executive branch of the District of Columbia government
with the purpose of influencing any legislative action or administra-
tive decision. For the purpeoses of this title, the appearance by
a person in his own behalf or representation by an attorney on
behalf of any person in a rule making, rate making or adjudicataiy
hearing before an executive agency or before the tax assessor; or
befcre the Ccuncil of the District of Columbia or one of its
standing or special committees if a public record is made c¢f the
proceeding; before the Council of the District of Columbia or one
of its standing or special committees lf invited by the Council
or committee during a public meeting, shall not be considered
lobbying. All cther activities by persons or attorneys, including
ex parte contacts to public officials, shall be considared

lobbying.



g ———

w: T4 -

"(g) The term 'lobbyist' means any person who engages in
lobbying. Public officials communicating directly or soliciting
others to communicate with oﬁhar public officials shall not be
deemed lobbyists for the purposes of this Act, so long as such
public officials do not receive compensation in addition to their
salary for such communications or solicitations and made such
communications and solicitaticns in their official capacicty.

"(h) The term 'cfficial in the executive branch' means
any candidate for public cffice in the executive branch or any
member, official, or employee ef an executive agency.

"{i) The term 'cfficial in the legislative branch' means
any candidate for Chairman or member of the Council in a primary,
special, or general electicn, the Chairman or Chairman-elect cr
any member cor member-elect of the Ccocuncil, any member cf a
commission established by and responsible to the Council, and
any officer, staff person, assistant, or emplovee of the Council
whether or not he receives remuneration and regardless cf the
source c¢f the income received.

*"(4) The term ‘public official' means any cofficial in the
executive, judicial, or legislative branch of the District of
Columbia government.

"(k) The term 'substantial economic interest' means
holding stock worth $5,000 or more, or 30 percent or more owner=-
ship of any business, ccrporaticn, partnership, proprietorship,
firm, enterprise, franchise, associaticon, organization, or cther

legal entity.



e 4 &

"Sec. 502. PERSONS REQUIRED TO REGISTER. =-- Except as
provided in section 503, a person shall register with the
Director pursuant to section S04 of this Act if such person-

*(a) receives compensation of $250 or mcre in any three
consecutive calendar month pericd for lobbying, whether that
compensation is sclely for lobbying or the lckbying is incidental
to that person's regular employment, except the provisions of
this paragraph shall not apply if the person required to file
hereunder is the only perscen requred to file under paragraph (b)
of this section and the perscn only receives compensation of $250
or more in any such period for lobbying from the person £iling

under paragraph (b) ¢f this secticn; or

"(b) expends $250 or more in any three consecutive calendar

month period for lobbying unless such funds are expended as bena
fide pelitical contributions authorized under this Act.

"Sec. 503. EXCEPTIONS. ~—A perscn need not register with
the Director pursuant to section 504 if such person is-

"(a) a public official, or an employee of the United
States acting in his official capacity:;

"(k) a publisher or working member of the press, radio,
or television who in the ordinary course of business disseminates
news or editorial comment to the general public;

"(c) any entity specified in section 1:&5 of Title II of
the District of Columbia Income and Franchise Tax Act of 1947
(D.C. Ccde, sec. 47-1554(4d)), activities of which is carrying on

propaganda, or otherwise attempting to influence legislaticn or



Enrolled Original

-15-—

administrative decisicn; or

"{d) any candidate, member, or member-elect of an
Advisory Neighborhood Commission.

*Sec. 504. REGISTRATION. -- (a) Each registrant shall
file a registration form with the Director, signed under ocath, on
or before January 15 of each year, or not latér than fifteen days
after becoming a lobbyist {(and on c¢r before January 15, of each
year thereafter). If the registrant is not an individual, an
authorized officer or agent of the registrarnt shall sign the form.
A registrant must file a separate registration form for each
persen from whom he receives compensation,

“(b) Such registratiocn shall be on a form prescribed by
the Director and shall include-

"{l) +he registrant's name, pe:maneﬁt address, and
temporary address while lobbying;

"(2) the name and address cf each perscn who will
lobby on the registrant's behalf;

"(3) the name, address, and nature of the business
¢f any person who compensates the registrant and the terms of
the compensaticn; and

“(4) the identification, by formal designation if
known, of matters on which the registrant expects to lobby.

The Director shall publish gquarterly all information required to

be submitted under this subsection in the District of Columbia

Register.



—julled Originﬁl

- 15 =

"Sec. 505. ACTIVITY REPORTS. -- (a) Each registrant shall
file with the Director between the first and tenth day of July
and January of each year a report signed under ocath concerning
his lobbying activities during the previous six month period. If
the reagistrant is not an individual, an authorized officer or
agent of the registrant shall sign the form. A registrant must
£ile a separate activity report for each person from whom he
receives compensation. Such reports shall be public documents and
shall be on a form prescribed by the Director and shall include

the following:

"(A) A complete and current statement of the information
required tc be supplied pursuant to saction 564 of this Act.

"(B) Total expenditures on locbbying broken down into the
following categories:

"(i) office expenses.

"(ii) advertising and publications.

"{iii) compensaticn to others.

"(iv) personal sustenance, lodging, and travel, if
compensatead.

*(v) other expenses.

Each expenditure of 550 or more shall also be itemized by
the date, name, and address of the recipient, and the amount and
purpose of such experditure.

"(C) Each political expenditure, loan, gift, honorarium,
or contribution of $50 or more made by the registrant or anyone

acting on behalf of the registrant toc benefit an official in the



—— W ks Bk VS ALl

-« 17 -

legislative or executive branch, a member of his staff or house-
hold or a campaign or testimonial committee established for the
benefit of the official, and shall be itemized by date,
beneficiary, amount, and circumstances of the transaction;
including the aggregate of all such expenditures that are less
than $§50.

"(D) Each business, in which the registrant knows or
should know that an official in the executive or legislative
branch is a proprietor, partner, director, cfficer, manager,
employver, emplovee, or has a substantial eccnomic interest and
with which the registrant hai engaged in an exchange of money,
goods, services, or any thing of .value if the total of such ex-
changes is $3500 or more in a six month periocd shall be identified
by its name and address, the official, the date, amount, and
nature c¢f each such exchange.

"(E) Each official in the executive or legislative branch
and any member of such official's staff who is compensated in
any manner by the registrant shall be identified by name and
natyre or employment,

"(F) Each official in the executive or legislative branch
with whom the registrant has had written or oral communications
(during the reporting period) related to lobbying activities
ccnducted by the registrant shall also be included in such report,
identifying the official with whom the communication was made

and the nature of the communication.



grelled Urigisad

- 18 =

*"(G) Each person whom the registrant has asked to lobby
on his behalf shall alsc be listed in such report.

"(b) Each registrant shall obtain and preserve all accounts,
bills, receipts, books, papers, and documents necessary to sub-
stantiate the activity reports required to be made pursuant to
this section for five yvears frcm the date of filing of the report
containing such items. These materials shall be made available
for inspection upon requests by the Director after reascnable
notice.

'(E) Each person about whose activities a registrant is
required to report under subsection (a) of this section shall
provide a full acceount of such activities to the registrant at
least 5 days before such registrant's report is due to be filled.

"(éd) Each registrant who does not file a report required
by this section for a given period is presumed not to be receiviag
or expending funds which are required to be reported under this
title,

"Sec. 506. RESTRICTED ACTIVITIES. -- (a) No registrant
or anyone acting on behalf of a registrant shall offer, give,
or cause to be given a gift ¢oc an official in the legislative or
executive branch or a member of his staff or household, that
exceeds 5100 in value in the aggregate in any calendar year.

"(b) No cfficial in the legislative or executive branc:
cr a member of his staff cor household shall solicit or accept
anything of value iﬁ violation of subsection (a) of this section.

"(e) No perscn shall knowingly or willfully make any

false or misleading statement or misrepresentation of the facts



Znrollasd Original

o Y9 -

(relating to pending administrative decisions or legislative
acticns) to any offici:l in the legislative or executive branch,
or knowing a document to contain a false statement (relating to
pending administrative decisions or legislative actions), cause
a copy of such document to be transmitted to an official in the
legislative or executive branch without notifying such official
in writing of ﬁhe cxuth,

"(d) Neo information ccpied from registration forms and
activity reports reguired by this Act or from lists compiled
from such forms and reports shall be sold or utilized by any
person for the purpcse of soliciting campaign contributions or
selling tickets to a testimonial or similar fund raising affair
or for any cormmercial purpose.

"(e) No public official shall be employea a lobbyist
while acting as a public official. :

"Seec, 507. PENALTIES, PROHIBITIONS, AND CITIZEN SUITS.
== (a) Any person who violates any of the provisions of this title,
shall be fined not more than $5,C00 or impriscned for nc longer
than twelve mcnths, or both.

"(b) In addition, the penalties provided for in subsection
(a) of this section, any perscn convicted of the misdemeanor
specified therein may be prohibited, for a pericd of three years
from the date of such conviction, from serving as a lobbyist.

"(ec) Any perscn who files a report or registration form
required under this title in other than in a timely manner, shall
be assessed a civil penalty cf $10 per day for each day (exclusing

Saturdays, Sundays, and holidays) the report or registration form



Zaralled Originay

is late. The Board may waive the penalty imposed under this
section for ggad cause shown.

"(d) Should any provisicn of this title not be enforced
by the Board, a citizen of the District of Columbia may bring
suit in the nature of mandamus in the Superior Court of the
District of Ceclumbia, directing the Board, to enforce the pro-
visions of this title. Reasonable attorneys fees may be awarded
to the citizen against the District should he prevail in this
action, or if it is settled in substantial conformity with the
relief sought in the petition, prior to order by the Court."

Sec. 303. The provisions of this title shall take effect
at the end of the thirty day periocd of Congressional review
provided for acts of the Council in section 602(¢) of the District
cf Columbia Self-Government and Governmental Reorganization Act,
(D.C. Code, sec. 1l=147(c)).

TITLE IV -- MULTILINGUAL ELECTION MATERIALS

Sec. 40l. This title may be cited as the "Multilingual
Elections Material act of 1376".

Sec. 402. As used in this title, the term "non-English
speaking person" shall mean a person whose native speaking
language is a language other than English, and who continues to
use his native lanquage as his primary means of .oral and written
communication.

Sec. 403. (a) In election wards in the District of
Columbia in which non-£nglish speaking perscns who speak the

same language constitute five percent or more of the eligible



Enrolled Original

& 21 -

voting population, as determined by the statistical office of

the District of Columbia government, the Board of Elections and
Ethics (hereinafter in this title referred to as the "Board")
shall cause all election materials, including, but not limited to
ballots, voting instructions, and voter pamphlets, to be supplied
in both the native language of such non=English speakinq eligible
voters and English.

(b) The Board may by regulation adopt lesser percentages
of non=English speaking perscns in a particular ward or precinct
who would be sufficient to obtain election materials in a language
other than English, and may by resqgulaticn, establish procedures
to allow non-English speaking parsons to participate in the
electoral process where such non-English speaking persons do not
constitute five percent or more of the eligible voting peopulation
in one ward or precinct.

Sec. 404. The provisions of this title shall take effect
at the end of the thirty day period of review provided for acts
of the Council in section 602(c) of the District of Columbia Self-
Government and Governmental Reorganization Act (D.C. Code, sec.
1-147(c)), or en July 1, 1976, whichever last occurs.

TITLE V ~- PRESIDENTIAL PREFERENCE PRIMARY

Sec. 501. This title may be cited as the "Presidential
Preference Primary Amendments of 1976".

Sec. 502. Section 5{(b) {5} of the District of Columbia
Election Act (D.C. Code, sec. 1-1105(b)(5)) is amended to read

as follcws: " (5) The delegates and alternates, of each political



Lorolled QOriginal

- B0 -

party in the District of Columbia to the naticnal convention of
that party convened for the nomination of that party for President,
alected in accordance with this chapter, shall only be obliged to
vote for the candidate whom he has been selected to represent in
accordance with property promulgated rules of the political party,
on the first ballot cast at the conventicn tﬁr nomineas for
President, or until such time as such candidate to whom the delegate
is committed withdraws his candidacy, whichever first occurs."

Sec. 503. Section S5(b) (4) of the District of Columbia
Election Act (D.C. Code, sec. 1-1105(b) (4)) is amended by inserting
the following at the end of the subsecticn: ", or name of the
perscn who shall manage an uncommitted slate of delegates, and the
Board shall publish a copy of the ballot required under this sub-

sectiocn in the District of Columbia Register 45 days prior to the

primary electicn."

Sec. 504. The last sentence of section 10(b) of the
District of Columbia Election Act (D.C. Code, sec. 1l-1110(b)) is
amended to read as follows: "Candidates receiving the highest
number of votes in elections held pursuant to this Act, other than
candidates for election as political party officials or delegates
to national conventions nominating candidates for the Presidency
and Vice Presidency of the United States, shall be declared the
winners." v

Sec. 505. The provisio-: of this title shall beccme
effective at the end cf the thirty day period of Congressional
review provided for acts of the Council in section 602(c) of the

District of Columbia Self-Government and Governmental



znrulied Origical
-5 -

Reorganization Act. (D.C. Code, sec. 1-147(c)).
TITLE VI -~ ENFRANCHISEMENT OF EX-FELONS

Sec. 601. This title may be cited as the "Enfranchisement
of Ex-Pelons Voting act of 197&".

Sec. 602. Section 2(7) (A) of the District of Columbia Election
Act, (D.C. Code, sec. 1-1102(7}), is amended to read as follows:

"(7)(A) Any person in the District of Columbia who has been
convicted of a crime in the United States which is a felony in the
District of Columbia, may be a qualified elector, if otherwise
qualified, at the end of his incarceration, or completion of his
sentence, whichever last occurs.”

Sec. 603. The provisicns of this title shall become effec-
tive at the end of the thirty day period of Congressional review
provided for acts of the Council in section 602(¢) of the District
of Columbia Self-Government and Governmental Reorganization Act.

TITLE VII =-- CONSTITUENT SERVICES AND REPEAL OF
EXPENDITURE LIMITATIONS

Sec. 701. This title may be cited as the "Constituyent
Services and Repeal of Expenditure Limitations act of 1976".

Sec. 702. Secticn 402 of the District of Columbia Campaign
Finance Reform and Conflict of Interest Act (88 Stat. 461; D.C.
Code, sec. 1-1162) is amended to read as follows:

"Sec. 402. (a) Each member of the Council elected by ward
may establish citizen-service activities within his/her ward. Each
member of the Council elected by ward may finance the operaticn of
such activities with contributions from persons, PROVIDED, THAT

contributions received by each such member do not exceed an



‘apolled Original

-

- 2 =

aggregate amcunt of §$10,000 in any one calendar year. Each member
of the Council elected by ward may expend a maximum of $10,000 in
any one calendar year for such programs. No persons shall make any
contribution which, and no member of the Council elected by ward
shall receive any contribution from any person which, when aggre-
gated with all other contributions received from that person,
exceeds $50 per calendar year, PROVIDED, THAT such $50 limitation
shall not apply to contributions made by any member of the Council
alected by ward for the purpose of funding citizen-service programs
within his/her ward. Each member of the Council elected by ward
shall file with the Director of Campaign Finance, a gquarterly
report of all contributions received and monies expeﬁded in accordance
with this subsection. No campaign activities shall be conducted nor
shall campaign literature or paraphermalia be distributed as part
of citizen-service programs conducted pursuant to this subsection.
"(b) The Mayor, the Chairman of the Council, and each
member of the Council elected at large may establish citizen-service
programs within the District of Columbia. The Mayor, the Chairman
of the Council, and each member of the Council elected at large
may f£inance the operation of such programs with contributions
from persons, PROVIDED, THAT contributions received by the Mayor,
the Chairman cf the Council, and each member of the Council elected
at large do not exceed an aggregate amount of $20,000 in any one
calendar year. The Mayor, Chairman of the Council, and each member
of the Council elected at large may expend a maximum of $20,000
in any one calendar year for such programs. No person shall make

any contribution which, and neither the Mayor, Chairman of the



’Enre;lad_Orisiqnl

- 38 @

Council, or any member of the Council elected at large shall
receive any contribution from amy person which, when aggrasgated
with all other contributions received from such person, exceeds
$100 per calendar year, PROVIDED, TEAT such $100 limitation
shall not apply to contributions made by the Mayor, the Chairman
of the Council, or any member of the Council elected at large
for the purpose of funding his/her own citizen-service programs
within the District of Columbia. The Mayor, the Chairman of the
Council, and each member of the Council elected at large shall
file a quarterly report of all contributions received and monies
expended in accordance with this subsection with the Director of
Campaign Pinance. No campaign activities shall be conducted nor
shall campaign literature or paraphernalia be distributed as part
of citizen-service programs conducted pursuant to this subsection.
"(c) Contributions of perscnal property from perscns to
the Mayor or toc any members of the Council or contributions of
the use of personal property shall be valued, for purposes of this
section, at the fair market value of such ;fcpcrty at the time of
the contribution. Contributions made or received pursuant to this
section shall not be applied against the limitation on political
contributions established in section 401 of this Act.
*"(d) All contributions and expenditures made by persons
to the Mayor, Chairman ¢of the Council, and each Member of the Council
as provided bé subsection (a) of this section, and all expenditures
made by the Mayor, Chairman of the Council, and each Member of the

Council as provided by subsection {(a} of this section, shall be



iorolled Original

- 26 =

reported to the Director of Campaign Finance quarterly cﬁ'fcrms

which the Di.;:ectnr shal; prescribe. All of th? record keeping

requirements of this Act shall apply to contributions and expendi-

tures made under this section. At the time a proqram:cf services

as authorized in subsection (a) of this sgctian is terminated,

any excess funds shall be used toc retire the debts of the program,

or shall be donated to an organization cperating‘in the District

of-Columbia as a not-fo?*profit organization within the me&ning

of Section 501(c) of the Internal Revenue Code of 1954, as amended.”
TITLE VIII -- MISCELLANEOUS PROVISIONS

Sec. 801. Section 305 of the District of Columbia Campaign
Finance Reform and Conflict of Interest Act (D.C. Code, sec. 1l-1155),
is repealed.

Sec. 802. Section 401 of the District of Columbia Campaign
Finance Reform and Conflict of Interest Act (D.C. Code, sec. 1l-11l61)
is amended by (l) striking the paragraph which follows "a member of
an Advisory Neighborhood Council $25." (2)Striking subsections (4) (2),
(d) (3), and (d) {4); and (3) striking (1) in subsection (d)."

Sec. 803. Section 201 of the District of Coclumbia Campaign
Finance Reform and Conflict of Interest Act (D.C. Code, sec. 1-1131),
is amended by deleting "$10" and inserting in lieu theresof "$50".

Sec. B04. Section 7(a) of Title VI of Article I of the
District of Columbia Income and Ffanchise-Tax Act of 1947 (D.C.

Code, sec. 47-1567 f(a) is amended by striking "$12.50, or $25"
agd inserting in lieu thereof: "$25, or $50".

Sec. 805. Section 703 of the District of Columbia Campaign

Finance Reform and Conflict of Interest Act (D.C. Code, sec. 1-1192)



Earolied originay

is amended by adding the following at the end of the Section:

"An individual defeated or elected to office as Member of the

Board of Education under this Act shall be authorized to transfer
any surplus, residue, or unexpended campaign funds to any charitable,
scientific, literary, or educational organization or organizations
which meet the requirements of section 47-1557b(a) (8) of the D.C.
Code; and an individual elected to an office under this Act and
authcorized to establish a program of constituent services under sec-
tions 402(a) of this Act (D.C. Code, sec. 1-1162(a) shall be
authorized to transfer any surplus, residue, or unexpended campaign
funds to his or her program of constituent sarvices;"

Sec. 806. Section l02(h) of the District of Columbia
Campaign Finance Reform and Conflict of Interest Act (D.C. Code,
sec. 1-1121(h})) is amanded by deleting "or group of persons.”
and inserting in lieu thereof a "period”.

Sec. B07. Should a court of competent jurisdiction declare
any portion of this act to be invalid, the remaining provisions
shall remain in effect.

Sec. 808. The provisions of this title shall become
effective at the end of the thirty day period of Ccngressional
review provided for acts of the Council in section 602(c) of the
District of Columbia Self-Gavernment and Governmental Reorganization

Act.



Considered in Councii

Docket for the Bill

5-3-76

Bill

1-120

First Voma

13-0

RECORD OF COQUNCIL VOTE

counci. mEmsEn | aTK | MaY | mv. [ as || counciL mamser | ave | nar | nv. | s || counci mEmeERr | Ave [war | wv. | am.
TUCKER ¥ DIXDN % | seavtoze [ x

MOORE, D. |y HARDY ¥ | wIrsow x

BARRY " HOBSON " WINTER X

CLARKE - MOORE, J. »

COATES & SHACKLETON |

X—ladicaies Voie A. B.—Absesnt

£00s moes

(Secretary of the Council)

Final Vots in Council S-18-78
13-0

RECORD OF COUNCI!IL VOTE
cCOouNCIL MEMBER | AYE | Mav Lu.v. AR | COUNGIL MEMSER | AYE | NAT | N.V. | 4.8. || COUNCIL MEMSER | ATE | NAY | M.V. | AR |
TUCKER e | DIXON X | SPAULDING X
MOORE, D. |y HARDY X WILSON X
BARKY Ix ROBSON X WINTER X
CLARKE ¥ MOORE, J. X
COATES X SRACKLETON X

X-—lndicates Vote A, Be=Abseng N. V=Moot Voting

Presented to tha Mavyor

i

Mavor's Action:

Approved:
Disapproved:

JW 4 u76

Enacted without Mayor's Signature

(Secretary of the Council)

(Secretary of the Council)

%Mﬁ‘z@f’

[Mayor s-Signature)

(Secretary of the Council)




Bill Docket o. 1-120
Page Two

Reconsidered by Council Vota

RECORD OF COUNCIL VOTE

COUNCIL. MEMBER | ATE | NAY | Mv. | Ad.|| counci wempzn | ATE | way | nv. | an. ]| councic mEMSER | AYE | Nav | mv. | aa.
TUCKER | DIXON SPAULDING b
MOORE, D. | | HARDY WILSON | 1
BARRY | HOBSON | WINTER

CLARKE MDORE, J.

COATES SHACKLETON !

X—Indicates Vote A B—Absemt N, V.—Mat Vating

(Secretary of the Council)

Presantad to the President

(Secretary of the Council)

Sustain Mayor’'s Veto
Not Sustain Mayor's Veto

(President of the U. S.)

F - B
Submittad to the Congress :

%ﬂzjﬁﬂi@ad_

(Secretary of the Council)

Senaw Action
Resolution Number

Housa Action
Resolution Number

(Secretary of the Senate) (Clerk of the House)

Enacted without Congressional acton

(Secretary of the Council)



